
 
 

“A GREAT PLACE TO LIVE AND WORK” 

BOARD of SUPERVISORS 

Laura Boyle Nester– Chair 
Fran McCusker– Vice Chair 

Michael Drossner 
Vincent Manuele 

Jacy Toll 
____________ 

 
Richard L. Mellor, Jr. 
Township Manager 

 

616 GERMANTOWN PIKE – LAFAYETTE HILL, PA 19444-1821 
    TEL: 610-825-3535      FAX: 610-825-9416 

www.whitemarshtwp.org 

 

WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

DEPARTMENTAL WORKSHIP MEETING OF AUGUST 13, 2020 6:00 PM 

ZOOM MEETING PARTICIPATION INFORMATION 

 

The Whitemarsh Township Board of Supervisors will hold their quarterly Departmental Workshop meeting on 
Thursday, August 13, 2020 at 6:00 p.m.  In response to the COVID 19 health pandemic, and to promote social 
distancing this meeting will be conducted via ZOOM.  Members of the Board, staff and public will participate 
remotely.  The public may join this meeting by either telephone using the dial in number or entering the URL on an 
internet browser.  Below you will find instructions on how to access and participate in the meeting:  

• Meeting Date: Thursday, August 13, 2020  
• Meeting Time: 6:00 PM  
• Meeting URL: https://us02web.zoom.us/j/81299021260 
• Meeting via Zoom App: if you have the Zoom App on your smartphone, tablet, or computer, open the program, click 

join a meeting, and enter the Meeting ID: 812 9902 1260 
• Meeting dial in number (no video): 1-646-558-8656 
• Meeting ID number (to be entered when prompted): 812 9902 1260 

Public comment via email to Township Manager Rick Mellor, rmellor@whitemarshtwp.org must be submitted one 
hour before the start of the meeting.   Public comment will also be accepted via the ZOOM chat button during the 
meeting.  In both cases you will need to provide your name and address for the record. 

Persons with a disability who wish to participate in the public hearing and require an auxiliary aid, service or other 
accommodation to participate in the hearing should contact Whitemarsh Township at 484-594-2601. 

 



WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
MEETING OF AUGUST 13, 2020 6:00 PM 

 
BOYLE-NESTER ____ DROSSNER_____MANUELE ____ McCUSKER ____TOLL ____  

 
 

CALL TO ORDER 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
   
PUBLIC HEARINGS 

 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

July 9, 2020 
 
BOARD PUBLIC DISCUSSION ITEMS     

Police Department Liaison 
Supervisor Michael Drossner 

Review SLD#01-20; Kevin and Donna McBurney/4013 Crescent Avenue 
Preliminary/Final Minor Subdivision Plan; Lot Line Change 
 

CONSIDER ACTION ITEMS  
 

Ordinances  
   
Resolutions  

Consider SLD#01-20; Kevin and Donna McBurney/4013 Crescent Avenue 
Preliminary/Final Minor Subdivision Plan; Lot Line Change 

 
Motions 

Consider Ordinance Advertisement 
Adopting the 2015 International Fire Code as the Township’s Fire Prevention 
Code 

Consider Board/Commission Resignation 
 Kate Johnston – Environmental Advisory Commission 
Consider 2020 Road Paving Program 

Authorize Notice of Intent and Bid Approval for Final Award 
Consider Change Order Request #2 

James D. Morrissey – Stenton/Flourtown/Cricket Intersection Project - 
$67,708.38 

Consider July 2020 Expenditures and Payroll and Pension Plan Paid Costs 
 $1,516,504.97 and $656,851.52 and $9,555.84 
 

PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD 
 
BOARD MEMBER COMMENTS 
 
ANNOUNCE EXECUTIVE SESSION 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 

PUBLIC PARTICIPATION INFORMATION 
 

1. Public meetings of the Board shall follow a prescribed agenda, which will be available to the general 
public two days preceding the meeting. 

2. If members of the public wish the Board to address a specific item at a public meeting, a written 
request to the Township Manager shall be submitted by noon on Friday of the week before the 
meeting.  The written request shall specify the item or items the individual desires to be addressed. 

3. The Board may consider other matters for the agenda as they see fit. 
4. The Board will entertain Public Comment at either the beginning of the meeting or prior to specific 

action items during the meeting, at the discretion of the Chair.  Individuals must advise the Chair of 
their desire to offer such comment. 

5. A Public Comment period will be provided at the conclusion of a meeting for input on any subject. 
6. The Board Chair shall preside over Public Comments and may within their discretion: 

 a. Recognize individuals wishing to offer comment. 
 b. Require identification of such persons. 

c. Allocate total available Public Comment time among all individuals wishing to comment. 
d. Allocate up to a five (5) minute maximum for each individual to offer Public Comment at a 

meeting, Township Staff shall time comments and shall announce, “one minute 
remaining” and “time expired” to the Chair. 

e. Rule out of order scandalous, impertinent and redundant comment or any comment the 
discernible purpose of which is to disrupt or prevent the conduct of the business of the 
meeting including the questioning of, or polling of, or debating with, individual members of 
the Board. 

  































































WHITEMARSH TOWNHIP 

Fire Code and Inspection 
Program 

Adopting the 2015 International Fire Code 
 

Nick Weaver 

7/31/2020 
 

 

 

  

A proposal to adopt the 2015 International Fire Code to be commensurate with the Pennsylvania 
Uniform Construction Code and implementation of an inspection program. 



1 
 

Table of Contents 
Executive Summary ....................................................................................................................................... 2 

Defining the Problem .................................................................................................................................... 3 

PA UCC Adoption ...................................................................................................................................... 3 

Enforcing a Fire Code ................................................................................................................................ 3 

Examples ............................................................................................................................................... 3 

Existing Building Inspections ..................................................................................................................... 4 

Business List & Permitted Work ................................................................................................................ 4 

Proposal ........................................................................................................................................................ 5 

Fire Code ................................................................................................................................................... 5 

Inspection Program ................................................................................................................................... 5 

Implementation ............................................................................................................................................ 6 

Fire Code Adoption ................................................................................................................................... 6 

Inspection Program ................................................................................................................................... 6 

Appendix A .................................................................................................................................................... 7 

Appendix B .................................................................................................................................................. 12 

 

  



2 
 

Executive Summary 
The adoption of the 2015 International Fire Code will provide the legal authority to enforce a current fire 
code. The township’s adopted fire code by ordinance is the 1982 edition of NFPA (National Fire 
Protection Association) 1 Fire Code. The Pennsylvania Uniform Construction Code presently utilizes the 
2015 International Code Council Series, such as our 2015 International Building Code. The building and 
fire code compliment and reference each other. A fire code is used to ensure buildings are occupied 
safely, whereas a building code is used to construct a structure safely for its intended use. Once a 
building is complete, inspected, and accepted, no further inspections are conducted unless there is a 
complaint or an official recognizes an issue while at the building for legitimate purposes. The adoption 
of a Fire Inspection Program would allow the township to enforce the fire code fairly and equally to all 
commercial properties of the township. The Program would also promote positive relationships with 
property and business owners with a shared mission of providing safe buildings. Visiting every 
commercial property annually would verify that all required permits are obtained for construction and 
operational purposes. A business list would be able to be up to date constantly with the valuable 
information available readily.  

  



3 
 

Defining the Problem 

PA UCC Adoption 
The adoption of the Pennsylvania Uniform Construction Code (UCC) and “opt-in” to enforce it in 2004 by 
Ordinance #791 adopts the codes utilized and referenced by the Pennsylvania UCC. This includes the 
International Building Code, International Fuel Gas Code, and International Fire Code. The original 
Ordinance #791 correctly does not reference a year, so the township uses the edition adopted by the 
Pennsylvania UCC, currently the 2015 editions, and does not require periodical updates with edition 
changes. Ordinance #791 only adopts appendices B (Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings), C (Fire 
Hydrant Locations), D (Fire Department Access Roads), E (Hazard Categories), & F (Hazard Ranking). 
Those are the only sections of the 2015 International Fire Code enforceable by Whitemarsh Township, 
with the exception of Chapters 9 Fire Protection & 10 Means of Egress that are exact duplicates from the 
2015 International Building Code. This error is common since the misconception is the Pennsylvania UCC 
incorporates the International Fire Code 

Enforcing a Fire Code 
Besides previously adopted ordinances prior to 2004, the Fire Marshal can only utilize NFPA 1 1982 
edition and the appendices of the 2015 International Fire Code. The enforceable code, with the 
exception of the previous mentioned items, is thirty eight years old. Notices of Violations and Citations 
must be issued utilizing a code that may pre-date possible property/business owners.  Construction 
methods, construction materials, contents of businesses, and contents of homes have drastically 
changed within that time frame.   

Examples 
See the provided examples that show a snap shot of a few items that cannot be regulated or enforced. 
This is not all encompassing and many more could have been mentioned. 

Hazardous Materials 
The International Fire Code sets requirements for all materials deemed harmful to life and the 
environment. The township couldn’t prohibit the improper storage or regulate this use of hazardous 
materials. This would include storing incompatible materials, such as an oxidizer with a flammable, next 
to each other which would only require a heat source to start a large fire. An auto body would not be 
required to ground their paint mixing station; grounding stops static electricity build up and inhibits 
sparks that could ignite the flammable paints. These are two examples out of over a hundred pages of 
hazardous materials regulations.  

Knox Boxes 
The International Fire Code, in Chapter 5, allows the Authority Having Jurisdiction (Fire Marshal) the 
ability to require Knox Boxes. Knox Boxes are emergency access systems utilized by emergency services 
that contain a key to gain entry to buildings during emergencies. Businesses and property owners could 
simply decline the installation since the key boxes were not in the adopted NFPA 1 code. 



4 
 

Fire Drills & Emergency Plans 
Schools, retirement communities, and large facilities are required to conduct fire drills and provide 
emergency plans according to Chapter 4 of the International Fire Code. The Fire Marshal has no current 
authority to require and drills or the creation of any plans. State requirements will have some facilities 
do this for state compliance with no required input from local fire code officials. 

Premise Identification  
Chapter 5 of the International Fire Code requires that the facility address and business name be required 
on the building and how. A property owner could put any style or type or address (as long as it meets 
the sign zoning) they wanted to, such as fonts or colors illegible from the street inhibiting the 
identification of buildings.  

Electrical Hazards 
Not to include the national electrical code in this proposal, the International Fire Code regulates 
electrical safety in buildings as well. Open wiring, open junction boxes, temporary wiring, extension 
cords, and clearances to electrical systems are regulated in Chapter 6 of the International Fire Code. 
Without a fire code the only time these items are checked is when the building is sold or a new business 
comes in. Electrical hazards cause a large amount of fires that could be prevented with easy 
maintenance of putting a cover plate over an outlet or not storing cardboard boxes on electrical 
transformers that generate heat. 

Existing Building Inspections 
Whitemarsh Township conducts existing building inspection of commercial properties. These inspections 
would have to utilize the legally adopted codes stated above, they cannot utilize current standards. 
There is no adopted ordinance that gives the township authority to conduct these inspections, a 
property could simply ask the township officials to leave at any point or refuse entry. Ordinance #54, 
which establishes the Fire Marshal, does grant the Fire Marshal the authority to enter properties. If a 
property refused entry to the Fire Marshal an administrative warrant could be obtained from the District 
Court for access. 

Business List & Permitted Work 
There currently is no up to date business list for the township. The Fire Marshal’s Office has reviewed 
the tax database to come up with an initial business list based on tax records. The township has no way 
to know if a business begins operation without them “self-reporting” to acquire a U&O. That is the same 
issue with permitted work, both construction or operational. Unless someone “self-reports” requiring a 
permit when they apply for it or an official drives by and see work being done there is no accountability 
of it. 

The township code of ordinances already requires operational permits set forth in Chapter 1 of the 
International Fire Code. These permits are not issued and the required fees are not charged. Examples 
of such operational permits would be: woodworking shop, places of assemblies, gas/repair stations, 
hazardous material, and high piled storage. 

  



5 
 

Proposal 

Fire Code 
The adoption of the 2015 International Fire Code by ordinance is a simple correction. A draft of the 
Ordinance is attached as Appendix A. It is drafted so the edition would match with the current code 
series adopted by the Pennsylvania UCC to correctly compliment it. The draft also contains all the 
previous requirements from the past into one document, rather than pieced through multiple 
ordinances. Another item in the draft is changing the requirements for fire hydrants. Prior to a robust 
fire code the township was proactive and required a certain hydrant with explicit specifications. These 
specifications are out of date and current standards require hydrants to be made with the appropriate 
specifications. It also reflects cleaning up fire department access that was proactively required by the 
township. All adopted requirements prior to the Pennsylvania UCC are included in the draft and are 
lawful, including ones that are more restrictive than the 2015 International Fire Code. This wording will 
ensure, such as Ordinance #791, a new ordinance would not be necessary every time the Pennsylvania 
UCC code editions are modified. Once adopted it would go in effect immediately. 

Inspection Program 
An inspection program can be started by adopting the proposed draft ordinance, attached as Appendix 
B. This draft requires all commercial properties, and lists all the occupancy types to ensure no confusion 
arises, be inspected annually by the Township. This would give the township the lawful right to ask 
businesses and properties access to their building for a fire and life safety inspection.  

The benefits of a formal inspection program requiring Annual Fire Inspections would ensure all buildings 
are safe for occupants. The Annual Fire Inspection is a maintenance inspection and focused on safety. 
Business and properties would not be required to come up to current construction code requirements 
unless they changed occupancy, had renovations or a new U&O as required by the Pennsylvania UCC. An 
example of this is on office that changes owners would not have new requirements implemented on 
them, but if the office became a store they would.  Besides ensuring safety of occupants, the inspection 
program would promote a positive relationship with all its businesses and maintain up to date 
emergency contacts for properties. Having inspections of properties annually will make certain 
necessary permits are obtained or existing operational permits that are not applicable are removed 
since the properties will be visited annually.  

The inspection program would also enforce the maintenance requirements set force by both the 
International Building (required currently without adoption of the fire code) and Fire Codes for fire 
protection systems. Fire protection systems (alarms, sprinklers, etc.) must be inspected annually. 
Cooking hood suppression systems in commercial kitchens require semi-annual inspections. Cooking 
hoods in commercial kitchen require cleaning on a monthly, quarterly, semi-annually, or annually based 
on their use. 

The Annual Fire Inspections would evaluate the need for any required operational permits and issues 
the applicable fees.  



6 
 

Implementation 

Fire Code Adoption 
The fire code draft ordinance must be reviewed by the Board of Supervisors and solicitor prior to 
advertisement. Once a final draft is approved the township manager can have it put on the next Board 
of Supervisors agenda. Both the Fire Marshal’s Office and Building Department have copies of the 2015 
edition of the International Fire Code on site. 

Inspection Program 
If the Board of Supervisors believes the proposed inspection program has value and should be 
implemented, a plan would have to be drafted to facilitate the program. The Board of Supervisors would 
need to determine if fees would be applied for inspections in addition to the already required 
operational permits and applicable fees. A plan for the program would be drafted and approved prior to 
the approval of the 2021 budget. The inspection program would not start until January 1, 2021. 

  



7 
 

Appendix A 
WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

 

ORDINANCE NO. ??? 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP, MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, ADOPTING 
THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AS THE TOWNSHIP FIRE PREVENTION CODE 

 

 WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of Whitemarsh Township has enacted the Code of 
Ordinances of Whitemarsh Township which includes, inter alia, provisions governing fire & life safety  in 
Whitemarsh Township; and 

 

 WHEREAS, said enacting Ordinance does prescribe a procedure for amendments to the code; 
and 

 

 WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors has determined that the recommended adoption of the 
2015 International Fire Code as the Township Fire Prevention Code to the Code of Ordinances, as 
recommended by the Fire Marshal, has merit and desires to implement this  adoption in the best 
interest of the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of Whitemarsh Township; 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, be it, and it is hereby ORDAINED by the Board of Supervisors of Whitemarsh 
Township, and it is hereby ENACTED and ORDAINED by authority of same as follows: 

 

I.  That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Fire Marshal of 
Whitemarsh Township, being marked and designated as the International Fire Code, 2015 edition, 
including Appendix Chapters B, C, D, E, F(these are already adopted under the UCC adoption), as 
published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of Whitemarsh 
Township, in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous 
substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of 
buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees 
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire 



8 
 

Code on file in the office of the Fire Marshal  are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, 
as if fully set out in this legislation, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, 
prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.  
 
II. That the following sections are hereby revised:  
 

A. Section 101.1. Insert:  Whitemarsh Township, Montgomery County 
 

B. Section 103.1, General, shall be modified and read as follows: 
 
The Department of Fire Prevention is established within the jurisdiction and under the direction 
of the Fire Marshal. The Fire Marshal/Code Official shall be in charge of the operation of this 
Department and its function shall be the implementation, administration, and enforcement of 
the provisions of this code. 

 

C. Section 103.2, Appointment, shall be deleted and the following language substituted: 
The Fire Marshal position shall be filled as prescribed in the Code of the Township of 
Whitemarsh. 

 

D. Add Section 105.1.7, Fees: 
 
"Fees for fire permits shall be in accordance with a schedule adopted by resolution of the Board 
of Supervisors." 

 

E. Sections 105.6 and 105.7, Required Permits, shall read as follows: 
 
"The Fire Code Official is authorized to issue permits and collect fees as enumerated in sections 
105.6.1 through 105.6.48 and sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.18 in accordance with the fee 
schedule adopted by resolution of the Board of Supervisors." 

  
F. Section 109.4. Insert: Summary, not to exceed $1,000, 30 days 

 
G. Section 202 shall have the following definitions added: 

 
FIRE MARSHAL -- The Fire Marshal of Whitemarsh Township, who shall also be the Fire Chief and 
Fire Official as referred to in this code 

 

(Old Ordinance Number 621, adopted 4-18-1991) 



9 
 

 

H. Section 111.4. Insert: $??? & Not to exceed $1,000  
 

I. Section 503.2.1 shall be deleted and the following language substituted: 
 
"Dimensions. Fire Apparatus access roads Access driveways/roads shall have an unobstructed 
width of 24 feet, exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with 
Section 504.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of 14 feet. feet for two-way circulation 
and 12 feet for one-way circulation; the minimum center-line radius on either type of access 
driveway shall be 70 feet; dead ends that exceed 150 feet in length shall be provided with an 
adequate turnaround area or a cul-de-sac with a minimum diameter of 90 feet; and No access 
driveway shall be located closer than five feet to a structure.  
 
(Old Ordinance Number 502, adopted 12-13-1984) 
 

J. Section 507.1.1 shall be added as follows: 
 
"All water mains shall be of sufficient size to provide at least 1,500 gallons per minute for fire 
hydrants. A loop system shall be used unless otherwise approved by the Fire Official." 
 
(Old Ordinance Number 502, adopted 12-13-1984) 
 

K. Section 507.5.7 shall be added as follows: 
 
"507.5.7. Fire hydrants. Specifications. Fire hydrants shall be Muller Hydrant, Model No. 107, or 
equivalent, with a dry barrel, three-outlet type having two two-and-one-half-inch side outlets 
with National Standard fire hose thread, 7 1/2 threads to the inch, and one four-and-one-half-
inch hard-suction connection, with National Standard fire hose thread, four threads to the inch, 
located on the front side. have National Standard Threads and be approved  by the Fire Official. 
The following criteria shall be required regarding installation: 
1. The hard-suction connection shall face the street, access driveway or fire walkway with the 

side outlets parallel to the cartway or walkway edge. 
2. A minimum clearance of 20 inches, measured from the bottom of the lowest outlet to final 

grade of ground or pavement, shall be provided. In no case shall said clearance be more 
than 26 inches. 

3. Fire hydrants shall be appropriately spaced so as not to exceed 500 feet between hydrants. 
4. Fire hydrants required to be located outside a street right-of-way shall not be accepted as 

public fire hydrants by the Township. 
5. Fire hydrants shall be located within five feet of paved streets, access driveways or fire 

walkways." 
 
(Old Ordinance Number 502, adopted 12-13-1984) 
 

L. Section 603.4 & 604.4.1 shall be deleted and replaced as follows: 
 
"603.4. Portable heaters. Portable heaters, vented or unvented, in any structure, other than a 
single-family dwelling, which is used wholly or in part for human habitation, shall be prohibited. 



10 
 

Portable heaters shall include, but not be limited to, heaters having a barometrically fed fuel 
control, with a fuel supply tank located less than 42 inches from the center control, with a fuel 
supply tank located less than 42 inches from the center of the burner, using gas, kerosene, 
range oil or No. 1 fuel oil for fuel. 
 

603.4.1. Prohibited locations. Unvented fuel-fired heating equipment shall not be 
located in, or obtain combustion air from any of the following rooms or spaces: sleeping 
rooms, bathrooms, toilet rooms or storage rooms. 
 
603.4.1.1. Certain sales prohibited. No person shall sell or offer for sale or install a 
secondhand, previously owned, space heater or portable stove which uses gas, 
kerosene, range oil or No. 1 fuel oil for fuel. 
 
603.4.1.2. Limited permissible uses of unvented kerosene heaters. Unvented kerosene 
heaters may be used in an agricultural building or a building under construction. Such 
heaters shall meet UL Subject 647 and bear the Underwriters' Laboratories, Inc. label, so 
certifying compliance." 
 

(Old Ordinance Number 502, adopted 12-13-1984) 
 

M. Section 5601.2.4 shall be changed as follows; 
 
$100,000 shall be changed to $5,000,000 
 
(Old Ordinance Number 502, adopted 12-13-1984) 

N. If any conflict arises between the 2015 International Fire Code (IFC), PA Act 43 of 2017, 
Ordinance #989, or Ordinance #990 the Act and ordinances shall supersede the IFC. 

 
O. All geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the 2015 International Fire Code are to 

comply with the Whitemarsh Township Zoning Code. 
 
III.  All ordinances of parts thereof inconsistent with this Ordinance are hereby repealed to the 
extent of the inconsistency. 
 

IV. The provisions of this Ordinance are declared to be severable.  If any provision of this Ordinance 
is declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid or unconstitutional, such determination 
shall have no effect on the remaining provisions of this Ordinance or on the provisions of the Code of 
Ordinances of Whitemarsh Township. 

 

V. This Ordinance shall become effective five (5) days following its legal enactment. 

 

ENACTED and ORDAINED this Nth day of Month, 2020. 



11 
 

 

ATTEST:     BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP 

 

 

____________________________________ _____________________________________________ 

Richard L. Mellor, Jr., Secretary   By:  Laura Boyle-Nester, Chair 

 

 

 

 

 

  



12 
 

Appendix B 
WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

 

ORDINANCE NO. ??? 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP, MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, 
ESTABLISHING AN ANNUAL FIRE SAFETY INSPECTION PROGRAM AND ESTABLISHING FEES THEREFORE 

 

 WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of Whitemarsh Township has adopted the 2015 
International Fire Code; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of Whitemarsh Township has determined that the health, 
safety and welfare of the community warrants the imposition of an annual fire safety inspection and 
permit program and the establishment of procedures and fees for obtaining such permits; and 

 

 WHEREAS, this Ordinance will provide greater uniformity, facilitate administration of permit 
fees, and set fees sufficient to cover the costs of administration; 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, be it, and it is hereby ORDAINED by the Board of Supervisors of Whitemarsh 
Township, and it is hereby ENACTED and ORDAINED by authority of same as follows: 

 

I. In accordance with the 2015 International Fire Code adopted by the Township all group A, A-1, 
A-2, A-3, A-4, A-5, B, E, F, F-1, F-2, H, H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4, H-5, I, I-1, I-2, I-3, I-4, M. R, R-1, R-2, R-3, R-4, S, 
S-1, S-2, and U occupancy classifications shall be inspected annually by the Fire Marshal, or their 
designee, who shall issue a Fire Safety Certificate which Certificate will be posted in a conspicuous 
location . 
 
II. Fire safety inspection permits shall be issued only after the Fire Marshal and his/her designee 
(hereinafter referred to as "Inspector") has inspected the premises and found the premises to be free 
from any violations of the Fire Code or any other state or local regulations concerning fire safety. 

 
III. Fire safety inspection permits shall be valid for the calendar year they were issued. 



13 
 

 
IV. The Fire Marshal shall devise a schedule for implementing the provisions of this Ordinance 
among the various uses and occupancies affected and shall devise and implement all plans and systems 
necessary to administer this program. 

 
V. The fee to be charged for the annual inspection and permit shall be set as determined from time 
to time by Township Resolution. 
 

VI. The provisions of this Ordinance are declared to be severable.  If any provision of this Ordinance 
is declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid or unconstitutional, such determination 
shall have no effect on the remaining provisions of this Ordinance or on the provisions of the Code of 
Ordinances of Whitemarsh Township. 

 

VII. This Ordinance shall become effective five (5) days following its legal enactment. 

 

ENACTED and ORDAINED this Nth day of Month, 2020. 

 

ATTEST:     BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF WHITEMARSH TOWNSHIP 

 

 

____________________________________ _____________________________________________ 

Richard L. Mellor, Jr., Secretary   By:  Laura Boyle-Nester, Chair 

 

 

 





I hope you are doing well! I have some bittersweet personal news to share and
wanted to inquire about the proper process. I recently bought a house in West
Norriton Township, PA and am very much excited about this new chapter in my
life. With that being said, I will be moving out of Whitemarsh Township and the
protocol for still being on the EAB will no longer apply. My settlement date is
August 3rd and I would like to serve on the EAB until then. Throughout the house
process, I wanted to wait until after all of the inspections went through properly to
ensure that I indeed would be going through with the sale. 
 
I would like to send a larger email to the group sometime this week to update the
entire board of this information and my departure but wanted to see if that would
be the best process. I would love to hear your thoughts. 
 
Thanks, 
 
Kate



 

 
65 East Butler Avenue│Suite 100│New Britain, PA 18901│Phone: 215-345-4330│Fax: 215-345-8606 

Gilmore & Associates, Inc. 
Building on a Foundation of Excellence 

www.gilmore-assoc.com 

August 12, 2020 
 
Mr. Richard L. Mellor, Jr., Township Manager 
Whitemarsh Township Municipal Building 
616 Germantown Pike 
Lafayette Hill, PA  19444 
 
RE: 2020 Road Improvements Project 

Bid Specification # 2020-01 
Whitemarsh Township, Montgomery County, PA 
Project Number 2020-01105 
 

Dear Mr. Mellor: 
 
As requested, we have reviewed the bids submitted to the Township and publicly opened on August 11, 2020 for the 
above referenced project with the following results: 
 

Bid Bond Bidder’s Name Base Bid 
Alternate 1 

(ADA Ramps) 
Alternate 2 
(Harts Lane) Total Bid Amount 

$39,600.00 Allan Myers, L.P.  $297,856.00 $50,283.75 $47,860.25 $396,000.00 
10% Glasgow, Inc.  $355,500.64 $60,899.02 $58,544.06 $474,943.72 
10% James D. Morrissey, Inc.  $380,484.65 $51,649.00 $81,828.65 $513,962.30 
10% GoreCon Inc.  $398,127.64 $50,706.99 $73,618.36 $522,452.99 
10% Highway Materials, Inc.  $375,598.15 $58,815.95 $92,477.15 $527,278.25 
10% T. Schiefer Contractors, Inc.  $422,281.87 $55,902.00 $70,170.78 $548,354.65 
10% Road-Con, Inc.  $406,188.37 $101,305.09 $89,977.61 $597,471.07 

 
Based on the attached bid evaluation that is summarized above, Allan Myers, L.P. is the lowest responsive bidder for 
the Total Bid for this project.  It is therefore recommended that the Board of Supervisors authorize the Township 
Engineer’s office to issue a Notice of Intent to Award to Allan Myers, L.P. for the Total Bid cost of $396,000.00 
 
Final awarding of the contract is contingent upon a successful outcome to the required Responsible Contractor 
Determination that will be performed by our office.  
 
This majority of this project will be funded by PennDOT Liquid Fuels Funding which will help offset the cost of 
construction. 
 
Should you have any questions regarding this matter please do not hesitate to contact me at this office.  
    

Very truly yours, 
 
 
 

        James J. Hersh, PE 
        Township Engineer  
c: Sean Kilkenny, Esq.; The Law Offices of Sean Kilkenny, LLC – Township Solicitor 
 Ms. Deana Shuler, Administrative Assistant  



BID TABULATION

2020 ROAD IMPROVEMENTS PROGRAM

BID SPECIFICATION #2020-01

BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2020

ITEM TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
No. QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

BASE BID

1 1 LS MOBILIZATION/DEMOBILIZATION 9,000.00$           $          9,000.00 35,000.00$         $        35,000.00 17,000.00$         $        17,000.00 7,744.21$           $          7,744.21 18,255.00$         $        18,255.00 8,800.00$           $          8,800.00 15,587.95$         $        15,587.95 

2 1 LS TRAFFIC CONTROL 10,291.86$         $        10,291.86 20,961.92$         $        20,961.92 11,000.00$         $        11,000.00 14,833.72$         $        14,833.72 27,400.00$         $        27,400.00 5,300.00$           $          5,300.00 10,181.42$         $        10,181.42 

3 1 LS SOIL EROSION & SEDIMENT CONTROL 50.00$                 $               50.00 1,282.00$           $          1,282.00 500.00$               $             500.00 1,249.20$           $          1,249.20 6,390.00$           $          6,390.00 1,200.00$           $          1,200.00 567.18$               $             567.18 

4 27,883.00 SY MILLING - 1.5" DEPTH 1.50$                   $        41,824.50 2.23$                   $        62,179.09 3.50$                   $        97,590.50 3.30$                   $        92,013.90 2.25$                   $        62,736.75 3.60$                   $      100,378.80 2.50$                   $        69,707.50 

5 2,557.00 TON SUPERPAVE WEARING COURSE 75.00$                 $      191,775.00 66.11$                 $      169,043.27 75.00$                 $      191,775.00 84.94$                 $      217,191.58 65.00$                 $      166,205.00 88.67$                 $      226,729.19 89.75$                 $      229,490.75 

6 43 TON SUPERPAVE BASE COURSE 92.00$                 $          3,956.00 194.75$               $          8,374.25 85.00$                 $          3,655.00 99.71$                 $          4,287.53 249.00$               $        10,707.00 101.00$               $          4,343.00 108.31$               $          4,657.33 

7 51 TON PENNDOT 2A STONE BASE COURSE 26.00$                 $          1,326.00 17.85$                 $             910.35 50.00$                 $          2,550.00 53.61$                 $          2,734.11 95.50$                 $          4,870.50 48.00$                 $          2,448.00 79.59$                 $          4,059.09 

8 47 CY BASE REPAIR EXCAVATION 14.80$                 $             695.60 136.08$               $          6,395.76 50.00$                 $          2,350.00 39.90$                 $          1,875.30 80.50$                 $          3,783.50 77.80$                 $          3,656.60 100.96$               $          4,745.12 

9 170 TON SUPERPAVE SCRATCH COURSE 71.00$                 $        12,070.00 95.51$                 $        16,236.70 79.00$                 $        13,430.00 80.43$                 $        13,673.10 115.05$               $        19,558.50 91.00$                 $        15,470.00 93.04$                 $        15,816.80 

10 27,883.00 SY TACK COAT 0.18$                   $          5,018.94 0.24$                   $          6,691.92 0.35$                   $          9,759.05 0.40$                   $        11,153.20 0.55$                   $        15,335.65 0.70$                   $        19,518.10 0.66$                   $        18,402.78 

11 19,374.00 LF JOINT AND CRACK SEALER 0.15$                   $          2,906.10 0.41$                   $          7,943.34 0.35$                   $          6,780.90 0.85$                   $        16,467.90 0.60$                   $        11,624.40 0.65$                   $        12,593.10 0.80$                   $        15,499.20 

12 27 EA BICYCLE SAFE GRATES (2' x 4') 449.00$               $        12,123.00 505.12$               $        13,638.24 625.00$               $        16,875.00 348.22$               $          9,401.94 742.05$               $        20,035.35 585.00$               $        15,795.00 418.97$               $        11,312.19 

13 3 EA BICYCLE SAFE GRATES (2' x 6') 449.00$               $          1,347.00 539.50$               $          1,618.50 850.00$               $          2,550.00 587.66$               $          1,762.98 901.45$               $          2,704.35 668.00$               $          2,004.00 606.80$               $          1,820.40 

14 296 LF 6" WHITE LINE, THERMOPLASTIC 5.00$                   $          1,480.00 2.75$                   $             814.00 2.70$                   $             799.20 2.94$                   $             870.24 7.90$                   $          2,338.40 3.18$                   $             941.28 3.06$                   $             905.76 

15 27 LF STOP BAR - 24" WHITE THERMOPLASTIC 16.00$                 $             432.00 10.20$                 $             275.40 10.00$                 $             270.00 10.91$                 $             294.57 31.25$                 $             843.75 11.78$                 $             318.06 11.34$                 $             306.18 

16 10 LF CONCRETE CURB 250.00$               $          2,500.00 301.23$               $          3,012.30 250.00$               $          2,500.00 136.34$               $          1,363.40 180.00$               $          1,800.00 147.23$               $          1,472.30 200.29$               $          2,002.90 

17 2 EA NEW YIELD TO PEDESTRIANS SIGN 310.00$               $             620.00 317.00$               $             634.00 310.00$               $             620.00 343.62$               $             687.24 444.50$               $             889.00 374.54$               $             749.08 290.67$               $             581.34 

18 8 EA YIELD TRIANGLE, WHITE THERMOPLASTIC 55.00$                 $             440.00 61.20$                 $             489.60 60.00$                 $             480.00 65.44$                 $             523.52 63.50$                 $             508.00 70.67$                 $             565.36 68.06$                 $             544.48 

ALTERNATE 1

A1-1 1 LS MOBILIZATION/DEMOBILIZATION 1,000.00$           $          1,000.00 700.00$               $             700.00 4,000.00$           $          4,000.00 981.66$               $             981.66 10,300.00$         $        10,300.00 500.00$               $             500.00 9,773.54$           $          9,773.54 

A1-2 1 LS TRAFFIC CONTROL 1,000.00$           $          1,000.00 1,500.00$           $          1,500.00 1,000.00$           $          1,000.00 1,090.73$           $          1,090.73 7,120.00$           $          7,120.00 500.00$               $             500.00 10,181.42$         $        10,181.42 

A1-3 1 LS SOIL EROSION & SEDIMENT CONTROL 500.00$               $             500.00 641.09$               $             641.09 500.00$               $             500.00 54.54$                 $               54.54 1,260.00$           $          1,260.00 500.00$               $             500.00 567.18$               $             567.18 

A1-4 10 SY PAVEMENT REMOVAL 25.00$                 $             250.00 133.00$               $          1,330.00 25.00$                 $             250.00 61.93$                 $             619.30 318.30$               $          3,183.00 30.00$                 $             300.00 116.49$               $          1,164.90 

A1-5 1 TON SUPERPAVE WEARING COURSE 1,600.00$           $          1,600.00 508.00$               $             508.00 75.00$                 $               75.00 1,105.56$           $          1,105.56 712.00$               $             712.00 300.00$               $             300.00 1,947.37$           $          1,947.37 

A1-6 3 TON SUPERPAVE BASE COURSE 75.00$                 $             225.00 382.00$               $          1,146.00 75.00$                 $             225.00 400.90$               $          1,202.70 726.00$               $          2,178.00 225.00$               $             675.00 557.90$               $          1,673.70 

A1-7 4 TON PENNDOT 2A STONE BASE COURSE 20.00$                 $               80.00 119.40$               $             477.60 20.00$                 $               80.00 143.69$               $             574.76 248.25$               $             993.00 90.00$                 $             360.00 232.08$               $             928.32 

A1-8 4 CY BASE REPAIR EXCAVATION 50.00$                 $             200.00 205.40$               $             821.60 50.00$                 $             200.00 304.61$               $          1,218.44 211.50$               $             846.00 100.00$               $             400.00 178.49$               $             713.96 

A1-9 10 SY TACK COAT 25.00$                 $             250.00 0.57$                   $                 5.70 25.00$                 $             250.00 1.00$                   $               10.00 7.05$                   $               70.50 6.00$                   $               60.00 0.64$                   $                 6.40 

A1-10 65 LF JOINT AND CRACK SEALER 0.15$                   $                 9.75 2.60$                   $             169.00 10.00$                 $             650.00 4.74$                   $             308.10 2.20$                   $             143.00 6.00$                   $             390.00 0.80$                   $               52.00 

A1-11 113 SY CONCRETE SIDEWALK/ RAMP 135.00$               $        15,255.00 253.30$               $        28,622.90 135.00$               $        15,255.00 137.11$               $        15,493.43 126.50$               $        14,294.50 189.00$               $        21,357.00 348.56$               $        39,387.28 

A1-12 93 SF DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE 25.00$                 $          2,325.00 45.90$                 $          4,268.70 25.00$                 $          2,325.00 5.87$                   $             545.91 56.20$                 $          5,226.60 35.00$                 $          3,255.00 51.50$                 $          4,789.50 

A1-13 195 LF CONCRETE CURB/CHEEK WALL 110.00$               $        21,450.00 76.50$                 $        14,917.50 110.00$               $        21,450.00 70.20$                 $        13,689.00 32.60$                 $          6,357.00 115.00$               $        22,425.00 117.89$               $        22,988.55 

A1-14 95 SY YARD RESTORATION 17.00$                 $          1,615.00 16.27$                 $          1,545.65 7.00$                   $             665.00 42.95$                 $          4,080.25 15.70$                 $          1,491.50 20.00$                 $          1,900.00 36.61$                 $          3,477.95 

A1-15 109 SY REMOVE EXISTING SIDEWALK 36.00$                 $          3,924.00 35.04$                 $          3,819.36 36.00$                 $          3,924.00 78.53$                 $          8,559.77 35.85$                 $          3,907.65 20.00$                 $          2,180.00 27.26$                 $          2,971.34 

A1-16 4 EA RELOCATE SIGN 150.00$               $             600.00 106.48$               $             425.92 200.00$               $             800.00 293.21$               $          1,172.84 183.30$               $             733.20 200.00$               $             800.00 170.42$               $             681.68 

ALTERNATE 2

A2-1 1 LS MOBILIZATION/DEMOBILIZATION 1,000.00$           $          1,000.00 842.17$               $             842.17 7,000.00$           $          7,000.00 1,417.95$           $          1,417.95 3,305.00$           $          3,305.00 737.00$               $             737.00 9,773.54$           $          9,773.54 

A2-2 1 LS TRAFFIC CONTROL 1,110.07$           $          1,110.07 2,165.08$           $          2,165.08 4,000.00$           $          4,000.00 2,119.10$           $          2,119.10 7,120.00$           $          7,120.00 1,178.00$           $          1,178.00 10,181.42$         $        10,181.42 

A2-3 1 LS SOIL EROSION & SEDIMENT CONTROL 50.00$                 $               50.00 641.09$               $             641.09 250.00$               $             250.00 272.68$               $             272.68 1,260.00$           $          1,260.00 118.00$               $             118.00 283.59$               $             283.59 

A2-4 3,152.00 SY MILLING - 1.5" DEPTH 1.50$                   $          4,728.00 2.05$                   $          6,461.60 5.25$                   $        16,548.00 4.13$                   $        13,017.76 3.50$                   $        11,032.00 3.60$                   $        11,347.20 3.95$                   $        12,450.40 

A2-5 289 TON SUPERPAVE WEARING COURSE 75.00$                 $        21,675.00 73.98$                 $        21,380.22 86.00$                 $        24,854.00 89.46$                 $        25,853.94 80.85$                 $        23,365.65 89.00$                 $        25,721.00 86.69$                 $        25,053.41 

A2-6 5 TON SUPERPAVE BASE COURSE 81.00$                 $             405.00 251.92$               $          1,259.60 100.00$               $             500.00 103.37$               $             516.85 344.75$               $          1,723.75 105.00$               $             525.00 161.28$               $             806.40 

A2-7 6 TON PENNDOT 2A STONE BASE COURSE 44.80$                 $             268.80 10.61$                 $               63.66 60.00$                 $             360.00 56.18$                 $             337.08 260.00$               $          1,560.00 48.00$                 $             288.00 115.56$               $             693.36 

A2-8 6 CY BASE REPAIR EXCAVATION 29.00$                 $             174.00 231.31$               $          1,387.86 100.00$               $             600.00 53.37$                 $             320.22 191.00$               $          1,146.00 78.00$                 $             468.00 130.75$               $             784.50 

A2-9 19 TON SUPERPAVE SCRATCH COURSE 72.00$                 $          1,368.00 99.47$                 $          1,889.93 87.00$                 $          1,653.00 103.56$               $          1,967.64 180.00$               $          3,420.00 95.00$                 $          1,805.00 129.81$               $          2,466.39 

A2-10 3,152.00 SY TACK COAT 0.19$                   $             598.88 0.14$                   $             441.28 0.50$                   $          1,576.00 0.92$                   $          2,899.84 1.00$                   $          3,152.00 0.70$                   $          2,206.40 0.66$                   $          2,080.32 

A2-11 1,611.00 LF JOINT AND CRACK SEALER 0.15$                   $             241.65 0.33$                   $             531.63 0.75$                   $          1,208.25 0.97$                   $          1,562.67 1.55$                   $          2,497.05 0.65$                   $          1,047.15 0.96$                   $          1,546.56 

A2-14 893 LF 4" WHITE LINE, THERMOPLASTIC 1.25$                   $          1,116.25 1.12$                   $          1,000.16 1.10$                   $             982.30 1.20$                   $          1,071.60 1.85$                   $          1,652.05 1.30$                   $          1,160.90 1.25$                   $          1,116.25 

A2-15 604 LF 4" WHITE LINE W/ RPMS, THERMOPLASTIC 4.00$                   $          2,416.00 7.96$                   $          4,807.84 7.80$                   $          4,711.20 8.51$                   $          5,140.04 1.85$                   $          1,117.40 9.19$                   $          5,550.76 8.85$                   $          5,345.40 

A2-16 691 LF 4" DOUBLE YELLOW LINE, THERMOPLASTIC 2.50$                   $          1,727.50 2.24$                   $          1,547.84 3.65$                   $          2,522.15 2.40$                   $          1,658.40 3.70$                   $          2,556.70 2.60$                   $          1,796.60 2.50$                   $          1,727.50 

A2-10 25 LF STOP BAR - 24" WHITE THERMOPLASTIC 7.50$                   $             187.50 10.20$                 $             255.00 10.00$                 $             250.00 10.91$                 $             272.75 10.80$                 $             270.00 11.78$                 $             294.50 11.34$                 $             283.50 

A2-11 968 SF 24" YELLOW GORE STRIPING 4.00$                   $          3,872.00 5.10$                   $          4,936.80 5.00$                   $          4,840.00 5.45$                   $          5,275.60 5.40$                   $          5,227.20 5.89$                   $          5,701.52 5.67$                   $          5,488.56 

A2-14 20 LF DOUBLE YELLOW DOTTED EXTENSION LINE 2.50$                   $               50.00 2.24$                   $               44.80 2.20$                   $               44.00 2.40$                   $               48.00 3.70$                   $               74.00 2.60$                   $               52.00 2.50$                   $               50.00 

A2-15 1 EA NEW "RIGHT LANE MUST TURN RIGHT" SIGN 215.00$               $             215.00 357.00$               $             357.00 215.00$               $             215.00 431.95$               $             431.95 444.30$               $             444.30 236.00$               $             236.00 350.78$               $             350.78 

A2-16 1 EA PAVEMENT MARKING "ONLY" 325.00$               $             325.00 255.00$               $             255.00 250.00$               $             250.00 272.68$               $             272.68 315.00$               $             315.00 295.00$               $             295.00 283.59$               $             283.59 

A2-10 1 EA PAVEMENT MARKING "THRU/LEFT ARROW" 210.00$               $             210.00 408.00$               $             408.00 400.00$               $             400.00 436.29$               $             436.29 190.00$               $             190.00 471.00$               $             471.00 453.74$               $             453.74 

A2-11 1 EA PAVEMENT MARKING "RIGHT TURN" 420.00$               $             420.00 204.00$               $             204.00 200.00$               $             200.00 218.15$               $             218.15 160.00$               $             160.00 236.00$               $             236.00 226.87$               $             226.87 

A2-14 1 EA PAVEMENT MARKING "25 MPH" 450.00$               $             450.00 408.00$               $             408.00 400.00$               $             400.00 436.29$               $             436.29 470.00$               $             470.00 471.00$               $             471.00 453.74$               $             453.74 

A2-15 691 LF RUMBLE STRIP 5.50$                   $          3,800.50 4.23$                   $          2,922.93 6.10$                   $          4,215.10 4.97$                   $          3,434.27 1.75$                   $          1,209.25 5.00$                   $          3,455.00 4.71$                   $          3,254.61 

A2-16 691 LF RAISED PAVEMENT MARKINGS (RPMS) 2.10$                   $          1,451.10 6.27$                   $          4,332.57 6.15$                   $          4,249.65 6.71$                   $          4,636.61 27.80$                 $        19,209.80 7.25$                   $          5,009.75 6.98$                   $          4,823.18 

Base Bid Total 396,000.00$      474,943.72$      513,962.30$      522,452.99$      527,278.25$      548,354.65$      597,471.07$      

Glasgow, Inc. James D. Morrissey, Inc. GoreCon Inc. Highway Materials, Inc.Allan Myers, L.P. T. Schiefer Contractors, Inc. Road-Con, Inc.



 

 
65 East Butler Avenue│Suite 100│New Britain, PA 18901│Phone: 215-345-4330│Fax: 215-345-8606 

Gilmore & Associates, Inc. 
Building on a Foundation of Excellence 

www.gilmore-assoc.com 

        August 14, 2020 
 

Mr. William A. Greer, Vice President 
James D. Morrissey, Inc. 
9119 Frankford Avenue 
Philadelphia, Pa 19114 
 
 
RE: Stenton Avenue/Flourtown Road/Cricket Road Intersection Improvement Project  

Bid Specification #2018-02 
Change Order #2 
Whitemarsh Township, Montgomery County, PA 

 
Dear Mr. Greer: 
 
Enclosed please find three (3) copies of Change Order #2 authorizing James D. Morrissey, Inc. (JDM) to perform 
the following work on the above referenced project.  The result of this change order is an increase of $67,712.38 
to the original contract amount.   
 
The project scope is being revised to include modifications related to delays and additional work resulting from 
PECO and Aqua main relocations through the project site, as summarized below.  JDM had to demobilize from the 
site in order to permit PECO and Aqua to relocate large diameter utility mains. 
 

1. Items C2-1 through C2-10 are required to remobilize crews, equipment and stored materials to the site. 
2. Items C2-11 and C2-52 are required to setup, repair and/or replace detour signage that had been damaged 

or removed while the contractor was off-site.  Additionally, detour signage is provided by a rental 
company, and additional rental time is required. 

3. As a result of the above-mentioned utility work, some stormwater pipe conveyances could not be installed 
while the full-closure detour was in place, and now need to be installed under flaggers.  Items C2-12 
through C2-51 are required to install the piping and engage flaggers for maintenance and protection of 
traffic. 

4. Prior to demobilizing, JDM winterized inlet grates and manhole lids by installing additional asphalt material 
around the structures to provide a ramped transition to protect vehicles and the structures.  This 
winterization must now be removed.  Items C2-53 through C2-60 are required to allow for this work. 

5. Since JDM has demobilized, Labor Wage Rates have increased.  In order to be consistent with the 
Township’s Responsible Contractor Ordinance to ensure that firms receiving public contracts provide 
adequate wages and benefits to their employees, items C2-61 through C2-77 are being added to reflect 
these increases. 
 

 
 
 
 
 



Mr. William A. Greer Page 2 
Bid Specification #2018-02 August 14, 2020  

 

 

 

Approval will be effective immediately upon the withdrawal of James D. Morrissey, Inc.’s litigation with prejudice.  
Please be advised that PennDOT has approved a closure of Stenton Avenue between Joshua Road and 
Flourtown/W. Valley Green Roads starting August 3rd, 2020.  James D. Morrissey, Inc. was issued a notice to 
proceed on July 22, 2020 and that construction activities must begin within 14 days from the date of that letter.  
The contract will be extended to require all work to be completed within 90 calendar days from the date in the 
notice to proceed. The date of completion of all work is therefore October 20, 2020. 
 
Please sign all three copies and return them to our office.  One fully executed copy will be forwarded to you for your 
files.  Should you have any questions regarding this matter, please contact me at this office. 
 
 
        Sincerely, 
        

 
 

        James J. Hersh, P.E. 
        Township Engineer 

Gilmore & Associates, Inc. 
 
 
 
c: Mr. Richard L. Mellor, Jr. - Whitemarsh Township Manager 

Sean Kilkenny, Esq., Law Offices of Sean Kilkenny - Township Solicitor 
 
    
O:\MUNICIPL\2020\2001106-WshT_HMI Intersection Improvements\00510-11-20-19\Construction\Payment\_change order #2.doc 

 
































































	ZOOM MEETING PARTICIPATION
	8.13.2020 AGENDA
	JULY 9, 2020 MEETING MINUTES
	SLD 01-20 MCBURNEY 4013 CRESCENT AVENUE
	FIRE CODE AND INSPECTION PROGRAM
	BOARD/COMMISSION RESIGNATION  - KATE JOHNSTON
	BID EVALUATION 2020 ROAD IMPROVEMENTS
	CHANGE ORDER #2 - JAMES D. MORRISEY
	JULY 2020 EXPENDITURES
	CERTIFICATES OF APPROPRIATENESS - 105 BLACK WALNUT LANE AND 3049 SPRING MILL ROAD



